
BID TABULATION: ROAD MATERIALS ANNUAL CONTRACT
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 4, 2020     3 PM
BID NUMBER: TF-2020-11

VENDOR 

NAME:

BUSINESS 

ADDRESS:

PLANT 

LOCATION:

Est. Annual 

Qty. (tons) Price per Ton Ext. Amount Price per Ton Ext. Amount Price per Ton Ext. Amount Price per Ton Ext. Amount Price per Ton Ext. Amount

Mfg Sand - Delivered 1000 $18.00 $18,000.00 $16.26 $16,260.00 no bid $24.00 $24,000.00 $29.00 $29,000.00

Mfg Sand - Picked Up $12.00 $11.13 no bid $18.00 $18.00

#57 Rock - Delivered 600 $20.00 $12,000.00 $19.41 $11,646.00 no bid $22.00 $13,200.00 $24.00 $14,400.00

#57 Rock - Picked Up $14.00 $14.28 no bid $16.00 $13.00

1" Road Base - Delivered 2650 $11.75 $31,137.50 $10.49 $27,798.50 no bid no bid no bid

1" Road Base - Picked Up $5.75 $5.36 no bid no bid no bid

Cold Mix Asphalt - Delivered 300 **disqualified no bid **disqualified no bid $68.10 $20,430.00

Cold Mix Asphalt - Picked Up **disqualified no bid **disqualified no bid $44.00

Mfg Sand - Delivered

Mfg Sand - Picked Up

#57 Rock - Delivered

#57 Rock - Picked Up

1" Road Base - Delivered

1" Road Base - Picked Up

Cold Mix Asphalt - Delivered

Cold Mix Asphalt - Picked Up

** disqualified bids do not meet specifications

2682 Wald Rd, New Braunfels

Colorado Materials

San Marcos, TX

5030 FM 2439, New Braunfels1504 Wald Rd, New Braunfels 2682 Wald Rd, New Braunfels

Brauntex Materials, Inc. Green Dream International LLC

New Braunfels, TX Erie, PA

Vulcan Constr Materials  $68.10/ton

noneVulcan Constr Materials  $44.00/ton

Vulcan Construction Materials

San Antonio, TX

1604 & O'Connor, San Antonio & 

Dabney Rd, Uvalde

Primary Supplier

Century Asphalt, Ltd

Baytown, TX

Brauntex Materials  $5.75/ton

Green Dream Int'l   $16.26/ton

Green Dream Int'l  $11.13/ton

Green Dream Int'l  $19.42/ton

Brauntex Materials  $14.00/ton

Green Dream Int'l  $10.49/ton

Green Dream Int'l  $5.36/ton

Vulcan Constr Materials  $13.00/ton

none

Secondary Supplier

Brauntex Materials  $18.00/ton

Brauntex Materials  $12.00/ton

Brauntex Materials  $20.00/ton

Brauntex Materials  $11.75/ton


