
BID TABULATION: Purchase of Transformers
BID OPENING DATE: January 9, 2024
BID NUMBER:

Qty Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
5KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 5 $2,460.00 $12,300.00 $1,275.00 $6,375.00 $2,588.00 $12,940.00

Manufacturer & Model ****
Calendar days for delivery ****

15KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 20 $2,817.00 $56,340.00 $1,925.00 $38,500.00 $3,612.00 $72,240.00
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

25KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 10 $3,021.00 $30,210.00 $2,130.00 $21,300.00 $4,576.00 $45,760.00
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

50KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 2 $4,024.00 $8,048.00 $3,140.00 $6,280.00 $7,041.00 $14,082.00
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

750KVA 277/480 Pad Mount 3 $0.00 $31,320.00 $117,065.00 $60,554.00 $181,662.00
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

Total:

168-182 days

NO BID

$106,898.00

Temple, TX San Antonio, TX

Howard Industries# ME-6930 Item1

AF-2024-11

KBS Electric Sunbelt Solomon Services, LLC Techline Inc.

Centra Moloney Sunbelt Solomon 

Austin, TX

Centra Moloney

Centra Moloney

Sunbelt Solomon 

Sunbelt Solomon 

168-182 days

168-182 days

168-182 days 42-56 days

Centra Moloney Sunbelt Solomon Howard Industries# ME-6930 Item 4

$189,520.00

490-518 days42-56 days
Howard Industries# ME-6930 Item 5Sunbelt Solomon 

$326,684.00

490-518 days42-56 days

490-518 days42-56 days

Howard Industries# ME-6930 Item2
490-518 days42-56 days

490-518 days
Howard Industries# ME-6930 Item3



Qty Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
5KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 5 $1,354.70 $6,773.50

Manufacturer & Model ****
Calendar days for delivery ****

15KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 20 $1,843.45 $36,869.00
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

25KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 10 $2,204.55 $22,045.50
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

50KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 2 $2,817.50 $5,635.00
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

750KVA 277/480 Pad Mount 3 $52,272.00 $156,816.00 $62,995.00 $188,985.00 $29,175.50 $87,526.50
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

Total:

Washington, MO

Dong-A Electrice CO., LTDNO BID

Gardena, CASan Antonio, TX
Nexgen Power, INC

308 days
Dong-A Electrice CO., LTDNO BID

308 days

756-770 days

$156,816.00

WEG Transformer

NO BID NO BID

WEG

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Dong-A Electrice CO., LTDDelta Transformers

$158,849.50$188,985.00

308 days126-140 days

308 days

308 days
Dong-A Electrice CO., LTDNO BID

Dong-A Electrice CO., LTD

Priester-Mell & Nicholson Inc



Qty Unit Price Total Price
5KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 5 $3,850.00 $19,250.00

Manufacturer & Model ****
Calendar days for delivery ****

15KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 20 $4,600.00 $92,000.00
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

25KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 10 $4,900.00 $49,000.00
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

50KVA 120/240 Pad Mount 2 $5,500.00 $11,000.00
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

750KVA 277/480 Pad Mount 3 $39,750.00 $119,250.00
Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

Total:

112 days

DB Transformer
112 days

PulseMAC Soultions
San Antonio, TX

DB Transformer
112 days

DB Transformer

$290,500.00

DB Transformer
112 days

DB Transformer
112 days
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