BID TABULATION:
BID OPENING DATE:

Pavement Maintenance Project - Heritage South, Windwood, & City Hall Parking Lot
September 1, 2015 3PM

BID NUMBER: TF-2015-40
Lone Star Paving Ace Asphalt Viking Construction
San Antonio, TX Marion, TX Georgetown, TX
Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
36,800 SY single course surface treatment,
Grade 5 Trap Rock, per Sq Yd $2.90 $106,720.00 $6.75 $248,400.00 no bid
1040 LF 4" parking lot striping, per LF $1.55 $1,612.00 $1.09 $1,133.60 no bid
Total $108,332.00 $249,533.60 $0.00
36,800 SY two course surface treatment,
Grade 3, + Grade 5 Trap Rock, per Sq Yd $4.70 $172,960.00 $9.00 $331,200.00 no bid
1040 LF 4" parking lot striping, geothermal,
per LF $2.45 $2,548.00 $1.09 $1,133.60 no bid
exception: striping is not
Total $175,508.00 geothermal $332,333.60 $0.00
36,800 SY Slurry Seal, complete, per Sq yd $4.15 $152,720.00 $2.57 $94,576.00 $3.60 $132,480.00
1040 LF 4" parking lot striping, per LF $0.00 $1.09 $1,133.60 $4.20 $4,368.00
exception: striping is not
Total $152,720.00 geothermal $95,709.60 $136,848.00




