BID TABULATION:
BID OPENING DATE:

Purchase of Steel Poles
March 25, 2025

BID NUMBER: AF-2025-45

KBS Electric Kennedy Wire Rope & Sling Co Morgan Ingland LLC

Austin, TX Corpus Christi, TX Morgan Hill, CA

Qty Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

30 FT Class 3 Pole 20 $1,459.00 $29,180.00 $2,233.30 $44,666.00
Manufacturer TAPP NO BID Valmont /SWR030C3
Calendar days for delivery 196-210 days 168-182 days
35 FT Class 3 Pole 25 $1,693.00 | $42,325.00 $2,401.20 | $60,030.00
Manufacturer TAPP NO BID Valmont /SWR035C3
Calendar days for delivery 196-210 days 168-182 days
40 FT Class 3 Pole 50 $2,055.00 | $102,750.00 $2,579.45 | $128,972.50
Manufacturer TAPP NO BID Valmont /SWR040C3
Calendar days for delivery 196-210 days 168-182 days
45 FT Class 2 Pole 10 $2,543.00 | $25,430.00 $2,978.50 | $29,785.00
Manufacturer TAPP NO BID Valmont /SWR045C2
Calendar days for delivery 196-210 days 168-182 days
45 FT Class 3 Pole 50 $2,312.00 | $115,600.00 $2,735.85 | $136,792.50
Manufacturer TAPP NO BID Valmont /SWR045C3

Calendar days for delivery

196-210 days

168-182 days

Total $400,246.00




MVA Power Inc Northrock Enterprises LLC SANPEC Techline, Inc
Montreal, Quebec Miami, FL Tomball, TX San Antonio, TX
Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
$1,090.10 $21,802.00 $2,116.78 $42,335.60 $1,329.00 $26,580.00 $2,002.00 $40,040.00
MVA POWER Galvanize - TRIFORCE SAN30CL3 Valmont /SWR030C3
‘ 168 days \ 161-175 days 154-168 days 182 days
| $1,30020 | $32,730.00 | $2,27592 | $56,898.00 $1,585.00 | $39,625.00 $2,153.00 | $53,825.00
MVA POWER Galvanize - TRIFORCE SAN35CL3 Valmont /SWR035C3

168 days 161-175 days 154-168 days 182 days
| $164950 | $82,475.00 | $2,44487 | $122,24350 $1,841.00 | $92,050.00 $2,312.00 | $115,600.00
MVA POWER Galvanize - TRIFORCE SAN40CL3 Valmont /SWR040C3

168 days 161-175 days 154-168 days 182 days
| $338540 | $33,854.00 | $2,823.10 | $28,231.00 $2,604.00 | $26,040.00 $2,670.00 | $26,700.00
MVA POWER Galvanize - TRIFORCE SAN45CL3 Valmont /SWR045C2

168 days 161-175 days 154-168 days 182 days
| $1,93490 | $96,745.00 | $2,593.11 | $129,655.50 $2,108.00 | $105,400.00 $2,453.00 | $122,650.00
MVA POWER Galvanize - TRIFORCE SAN45CL3 Valmont /SWR045C3
168 days 161-175 days 154-168 days 182 days
Total  $379,363.60 Total  $289,695.00 Total  $358,815.00




Technology International, Inc.

Texas Electric Cooperatives

Lake Mary, FL

Georgetown, TX

Unit Price Extended Price

Unit Price Extended Price

$2,165.00 $43,300.00

$2,044.21 $40,884.20

Valmont /SWR030C3

Valmont /SWR030C3

252 days

154-168 days

$2,32800 | $58,200.00

$2,197.89 | $54,947.25

Valmont /SWR035C3

Valmont /SWR035C3

252 days

154-168 days

$2,500.00 | $125,000.00

$2,361.05 | $118,052.50

Valmont /SWR040C3

Valmont /SWR040C3

252 days

154-168 days

$2,890.00 | $28,900.00

$2,726.31 | $27,263.10

Valmont /SWR045C2

Valmont /SWR045C2

252 days

154-168 days

$2,653.00 | $132,650.00

$2,504.21 | $125,210.50

Valmont /SWR045C3

Valmont /SWR045C3

252 days

154-168 days

Total $388,050.00

Total $366,357.55




