
BID TABULATION: Purchase of Transformers

BID OPENING DATE: March 11, 2025

BID NUMBER:

Qty Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

300 KVA 277/480 Pad Mount
4 $16,078.05 $64,312.20 $15,117.00 $60,468.00 $16,000.00 $64,000.00

Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

500 KVA 120/208 Pad Mount
3 $19,495.12 $58,485.36 $20,010.00 $60,030.00 $32,000.00 $96,000.00

Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

500 KVA 277/480 Pad Mount
3 $17,695.12 $53,085.36 $19,800.00 $59,400.00 $27,500.00 $82,500.00

Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

167 KVA 120/240 Pad Mount
3 $6,548.78 $19,646.34 $9,050.00 $27,150.00

Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

750 KVA 120/20 Pad Mount 3 $29,441.46 $88,324.38 $26,900.00 $80,700.00 $43,500.00 $130,500.00

Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

225 KVA 120/208 Pad Mount
2 $14,735.37 $29,470.74 $14,900.00 $29,800.00 $15,500.00 $31,000.00

Anixter AR Transformers Inc

189-203 days

189-203 days

AF-2025-40

GE# QRJZ769 Eaglerise

EagleriseGE# qmbf620

Maddox Transformers

84 days

GE# QRJZ770 Eaglerise

84 days

112-126 days 84 days

189-203 days 84 days

GE# QRJZ771 Eaglerise

GE# QRJZ772 Eaglerise

189-203 days 84 days

Maddox Transformers

168-182 days

Maddox Transformers

168-182 days

NO BID

168-182 days

Maddox Transformers

168-182 days

ECB Solutions, LLC



Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

1500 KVA 277/480 Pad Mount 2 $38,265.85 $76,531.70 $38,200.00 $76,400.00 $56,000.00 $112,000.00

Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

25 KVA 120/240 Pole Mount 25 $1,640.24 $41,006.00 $1,817.00 $45,425.00 $0.00

Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

15 KVA 120/240 Pole Mount 25 $1,435.37 $35,884.25 $1,517.00 $37,925.00 $0.00

Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

10 KVA 120/240 Pole Mount 10 $1,391.46 $13,914.60 $1,415.00 $14,150.00 $0.00

Manufacturer & Model ****

Calendar days for delivery ****

Total:

84 days

GE# QAOX580 Eaglerise NO BID

NO BID

112-126 days 84 days

168-182 days

GE# QRJZ774 Eaglerise Maddox Transformers

GE# QRJZ773 Eaglerise Maddox Transformers

$480,660.93 $491,448.00

GE# QAOX578 Eaglerise

189-203 days 84 days

266-280 days 84 days

GE# QAOX579 Eaglerise

112-126 days 84 days

112-126 days

$516,000.00

NO BID

168-182 days



Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price

$30,478.00 $121,912.00 $18,373.30 $73,493.20 $119,189.20 $476,756.80 $21,950.00

$49,476.00 $148,428.00 $26,042.50 $78,127.50 $126,678.50 $380,035.50 $25,120.00

$38,271.00 $114,813.00 $20,202.60 $60,607.80 $126,678.50 $380,035.50 $24,300.00

$0.00 $0.00 $7,749.50 $23,248.50 $44,283.20 $132,849.60 $11,000.00

$70,865.00 $212,595.00 $37,081.00 $111,243.00 $151,109.92 $453,329.76 $27,500.00

$27,838.00 $55,676.00 $18,221.50 $36,443.00 $115,162.32 $230,324.64 $19,550.00

210 days 80 days

6000-SE_TX-60 Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

285-084-00038 SSEL

182 days

210 days 80 days

210 days 80 days

6000-SE_TX-39 Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

WEG Transformers USA

WEG Transformers USA 285-084-00040 SSEL

252-266 days 182 days

WEG Transformers USA 285-084-00060 SSEL

364-378 days 182 days

NO BID 285-084-00042 SSEL

252-266 days 182 days

WEG Transformers USA 285-084-00039 SSEL

252-266 days 182 days

EHV Solutions, LLC GD Partners Group Inc GLAWN JDI Intergrations, LLC

6000-SE_TX-38 Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

210 days 80 days

6000-SE_TX-40 Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

210 days 80 days

6000-SE_TX-42 Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd



$86,484.00 $172,968.00 $40,147.80 $80,295.60 $187,323.76 $374,647.52 $37,280.00

$0.00 $0.00 $2,103.35 $52,583.75 $0.00 $0.00 $2,480.00

$0.00 $0.00 $1,974.55 $49,363.75 $0.00 $0.00 $2,200.00

$0.00 $0.00 $1,976.85 $19,768.50 $0.00 $0.00 $2,100.00

182 days 80 days

NO BID 285-084-00014 SSEL NO BID Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

182 days 80 days

NO BID 285-084-00015 SSEL NO BID Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

182 days 80 days

NO BID Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

364-378 days 182 days 210 days 80 days

WEG Transformers USA 285-084-00056 SSEL 6000-SE_TX-38 Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

210 days 80 days

WEG Transformers USA 285-084-00061 SSEL 6000-SE_TX-61 Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

$826,392.00 $585,174.60

NO BID 285-084-00017 SSEL

252-266 days 182 days

$2,427,979.32 $603,220.00



Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

$87,800.00 $15,885.00 $63,540.00 $17,500.00 $70,000.00 $24,696.00 $98,784.00

$75,360.00 $20,314.00 $60,942.00 $24,800.00 $74,400.00 $28,336.00 $85,008.00

$72,900.00 $20,314.00 $60,942.00 $22,500.00 $67,500.00 $28,336.00 $85,008.00

$33,000.00 $10,543.00 $31,629.00 $6,500.00 $19,500.00 $14,056.00 $42,168.00

$82,500.00 $34,372.00 $103,116.00 $36,900.00 $110,700.00 $43,456.00 $130,368.00

$39,100.00 $14,200.00 $28,400.00 $17,900.00 $35,800.00 $25,256.00 $50,512.00

154 DAYS80 days 182-196 days

KEREC CO., LTD. PDMT3P750KVAJiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd Rymel

80 days 182-196 days

Rymel

80 days 182-196 days

Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd Rymel

154 DAYS

JDI Intergrations, LLC KBS Electrical Distributors KEREC Co., LTD

Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

KEREC CO., LTD.

80 days 182-196 days 154 DAYS

Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd Rymel KEREC CO., LTD.

112 DAYS

MVA Power Inc

PDMT3P300KVA

PDMT3P500KVA

PDMT3P500KVA

224 days

80 days 182-196 days 154 DAYS

Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd

KEREC CO., LTD.

Rymel KEREC CO., LTD.

224 days

224 days

224 days

PDMT1P167KVA

224 days



$74,560.00 $44,705.00 $89,410.00 $42,900.00 $85,800.00 $60,536.00 $121,072.00

$62,000.00 $2,094.00 $52,350.00 $1,800.00 $45,000.00 $4,838.40 $120,960.00

$55,000.00 $1,870.00 $46,750.00 $1,700.00 $42,500.00 $4,670.40 $116,760.00

$21,000.00 $1,644.00 $16,440.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $4,312.00 $43,120.00

80 days 140 days 126 DAYS

PDMT3P250KVA

224 days

Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd Rymel KEREC CO., LTD.

126 DAYS80 days 140 days 224 days

Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd Rymel

126 DAYS

KEREC CO., LTD. PDMT1P15KVA

224 days80 days 140 days

Jiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd Rymel KEREC CO., LTD. PDMT1P25KVA

80 days 182-196 days

KEREC CO., LTD.

154 DAYS 224 days

PDMT3P150KVAJiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd Rymel

154 DAYS80 days 182-196 days

KEREC CO., LTD. PDMT3P250KVAJiangshan Scotech Electrical Co., Ltd Rymel

$603,220.00 $553,519.00 $566,200.00 $893,760.00

224 days



Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price

$14,610.00 $58,440.00 $35,620.00 $142,480.00 $34,494.00 $137,976.00 $15,510.58

$17,850.00 $53,550.00 $53,563.00 $160,689.00 $44,415.00 $133,245.00 $18,807.05

$17,060.00 $51,180.00 $61,568.00 $184,704.00 $35,852.00 $107,556.00 $17,070.58

$12,520.00 $37,560.00 $31,515.00 $94,545.00 $9,503.00 $28,509.00 $6,741.17

$22,360.00 $67,080.00 $78,855.00 $236,565.00 $66,575.00 $199,725.00 $28,402.35

$13,800.00 $27,600.00 $35,660.00 $71,320.00 $25,209.00 $50,418.00 $14,215.29

KD Electric HOWARD INDUSTRIES Cetral Moloney QRJZ677

PanAmerica Supply, Inc. TECHLINE, INC. TECHNOLOGY INTERNATIONAL, INC. TEXAS ELECTRIC COOPERATIVES

KD Electric HOWARD INDUSTRIES Cetral Moloney QRJZ672

147 days 434-462 days 364 days 105-112 days

KD Electric HOWARD INDUSTRIES Cetral Moloney QRJZ674

147 days 434-462 days 364 days 105-112 days

KD Electric HOWARD INDUSTRIES Cetral Moloney QRJZ675

147 days 434-462 days 364 days 105-112 days

KD Electric HOWARD INDUSTRIES Cetral Moloney QRJZ619

147 days 574-602 days 364 days 105-112 days

147 days 434-462 days 364 days 105-112 days



$30,000.00 $60,000.00 $115,134.00 $230,268.00 $99,394.00 $198,788.00 $36,915.29

$1,380.00 $34,500.00 $4,420.00 $110,500.00 $2,723.00 $68,075.00 $1,582.35

$1,200.00 $30,000.00 $3,489.00 $87,225.00 $2,397.00 $59,925.00 $1,384.70

$1,120.00 $11,200.00 $3,065.00 $30,650.00 $2,243.00 $22,430.00 $1,342.35

KD Electric HOWARD INDUSTRIES Cetral Moloney QAOX511

147 days 182-210 days 364 days 70-84 days

KD Electric HOWARD INDUSTRIES Cetral Moloney QAOX510

147 days 182-210 days 364 days 70-84 days

147 days 182-210 days 364 days 70-84 days

147 days 434-462 days 364 days 224-238 days

KD Electric HOWARD INDUSTRIES Cetral Moloney QAOX509

KD Electric HOWARD INDUSTRIES Cetral Moloney QRJZ679

Not being purchased at this time

KD Electric HOWARD INDUSTRIES Cetral Moloney QRJZ678

$431,110.00 $1,348,946.00 $1,006,647.00 $464,966.68

147 days 434-462 days 364 days 105-112 days



Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

$62,042.32 $29,478.21 $117,912.84 $15,800.00 $63,200.00 $30,478.00 $121,912.00

$56,421.15 $36,225.00 $108,675.00 $18,550.00 $55,650.00 $49,476.00 $148,428.00

$51,211.74 $35,172.00 $105,516.00 $18,550.00 $55,650.00 $38,271.00 $114,813.00

$20,223.51 $17,206.71 $51,620.13 $5,750.00 $17,250.00 $0.00 $0.00

$85,207.05 $46,602.00 $139,806.00 $26,250.00 $78,750.00 $70,865.00 $212,595.00

$28,430.58 $28,309.50 $56,619.00 $16,930.00 $33,860.00 $27,838.00 $55,676.00

QRJZ677 ULSCorporate INC United TRS Electric WEG Transformers USA

TEXAS ELECTRIC COOPERATIVES ULS CORPORATE INC

QRJZ672 ULSCorporate INC

105-112 days 168 days

QRJZ674 ULSCorporate INC

105-112 days 168 days

QRJZ675 ULSCorporate INC

105-112 days 168 days

QRJZ619 ULSCorporate INC

105-112 days 168 days

105-112 days 168 days

UNITES TRS ELECTRIC, INC. WEG TRANSFORMERS USA

United TRS Electric WEG Transformers USA

105 days 252-266 days

United TRS Electric WEG Transformers USA

49 days

70 days 252-266 days

United TRS Electric WEG Transformers USA

70 days 252-266 days

United TRS Electric NO BID

105 days 364-378 days



$73,830.58 $57,199.50 $114,399.00 $38,700.00 $77,400.00 $86,484.00 $172,968.00

$39,558.75 $3,702.86 $92,571.50 $2,020.00 $50,500.00 $0.00 $0.00

$34,617.50 $3,419.36 $85,484.00 $2,010.00 $50,250.00 $0.00 $0.00

$13,423.50 $3,338.36 $33,383.60 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $0.00 $0.00

QAOX511 ULSCorporate INC United TRS Electric

70-84 days 168 days 49 days

QAOX510 ULSCorporate INC United TRS Electric NO BID

70-84 days 168 days 49 days

70-84 days 168 days 49 days

224-238 days 168 days 105 days 364-378 days

QAOX509

QRJZ679 ULSCorporate INC United TRS Electric WEG Transformers USA

Not being purchased at this time

QRJZ678 ULSCorporate INC United TRS Electric

$464,966.68 $905,987.07

ULSCorporate INC

105-112 days 168 days

$502,510.00 $826,392.00

United TRS Electric NO BID

WEG Transformers USA

49 days 252-266 days

NO BID


