7/2/2024 Bid Tab - Electric AF-2024-36 KBS ECB WEG PMN Gridlink Power Kijero MP Predictive MVA Power Pro-Line Pulsemac Techline Tech Inter ULS Anixter

Commodity# QTyY ltem Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead Bid / each Total Lead
285-084-00031 1 150 KVA 120/208 Pad Mount $14,560.00 $14,560.00 [224-231 dys no bid $24,117.00 $24,117.00 | 56-58 wks | $17,488.00 $17,488.00 |120-160 dys no bid $25,012.63 $25,012.63 340 dys $35,524.50 $35,524.50 96-98 wks | $21,270.00 $21,270.00 210 dys $25,577.26 $25,577.26 150 dys $18,070.56 $18,070.56 80 dys $25,934.00 $25,934.00 448 dys $19,606.00 $19,606.00 224 dys $19,495.75 $19,495.75 |160-180dys| $17,685.35 $17,685.35 25-Jun
285-084-00036 10  |300 KVA 120/208 Pad Mount $19,050.00 $190,500.00 [224-231 dys no bid $34,899.00 $348,990.00 | 56-58 wks | $22,375.00 $223,750.00 [120-160dys| $28,100.00 $281,000.00 243 dys $29,817.89 $298,178.90 340 dys $40,797.90 $407,979.00 96-98 wks |  $24,480.00 $244,800.00 210 dys $29,962.85 $299,628.50 150 dys $21,109.68 $211,096.80 80 dys $37,588.00 $375,880.00 448 dys $23,165.00 $231,650.00 224 dys $24,306.77 $243,067.70 |160-180dys| $22,525.35 $225,253.50 25-Jun
285-084-00039 7 |500 KVA 120/208 Pad Mount $24,220.00 $169,540.00 [224-231 dys no bid $50,747.00 $355,229.00 | 56-58 wks | $28,675.00 $200,725.00 [120-160dys| $33,900.00 $237,300.00 243 dys $38,018.90 $266,132.30 340 dys $55,390.50 $387,733.50 96-98 wks | $28,062.85 $196,439.95 210 dys $31,547.22 $220,830.54 150 dys $31,020.84 $217,145.88 80 dys $47,674.00 $333,718.00 448 dys $27,459.00 $192,213.00 224 dys $28,906.20 $202,343.40 |160-180dys| $37,268.00 $260,876.00 25-Jun
285-084-00040 2 |500 KVA 277/480 Pad Mount $24,220.00 $48,440.00 [224-231 dys no bid $40,988.00 $81,976.00 | 56-58 wks | $30,613.00 $61,226.00 [120-160dys| $33,900.00 $67,800.00 243 dys $33,482.11 $66,964.22 340 dys $62,645.00 $125,290.00 96-98 wks |  $28,620.00 $57,240.00 210 dys $36,500.00 $73,000.00 150 dys $21,714.48 $43,428.96 80 dys $41,972.00 $83,944.00 448 dys $27,459.00 $54,918.00 224 dys $28,856.02 $57,712.04 |160-180dys| $20,520.00 $41,040.00 25-Jun
285-084-00060 1 |750 KVA 120/208 Pad Mount $49,600.00 $49,600.00 [224-231dys| $64,000.00 $64,000.00 250 dys $61,520.00 $61,520.00 | 60-62 wks $35,563.00 |120-160dys| $44,400.00 $44,400.00 243 dys $52,855.79 $52,855.79 340 dys $78,467.40 $78,467.40 74-76 wks | $42,000.00 $42,000.00 210 dys $39,949.00 150 dys $31,534.92 80 dys $71,376.00 $71,376.00 448 dys $33,618.00 224 dys $33,797.25 $33,797.25 |160-180dys| $51,481.35 $51,481.35 25-Aug
285-084-00056 3 1500 KVA 277/480 Pad Mount $102,240.00 $306,720.00 [224-231dys| $78,500.00 $235,500.00 250 dys $71,164.00 $213,492.00 | 60-62 wks $153,714.00 [120-160dys| $67,800.00 $203,400.00 243 dys $67,814.74 $203,444.22 340 dys $116,061.00 $348,183.00 74-76 wks |  $67,520.00 $202,560.00 210 dys $62,949.00 $188,847.00 150 dys $115,389.36 80 dys $104,089.00 $312,267.00 448 dys $155,940.00 224 dys $45,339.91 $136,019.73 |160-180dys| $52,028.00 $156,084.00 25-Aug

$779,360.00 $299,500.00 $1,085,324.00 $692,466.00 $833,900.00 $912,588.06 $1,383,177.40 $764,309.95 $847,832.30 $636,666.48 $1,203,119.00 $687,945.00 $692,435.87 $752,420.20

Subtotal

Low Bid

Not Qualitified




